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you can run but you can't hide i will be right by your
side ohhhhhhh yeah cause I've been thinking bout you
thinking bout you 
It's the way you make me feel you can run but you can't
hide baby you just can't deny that you've been thinking
bout me thinking bout me there's nothing to conceal 

you and I have so much in common think you know
baby what I mean you're actin like you don't want me
but that's not the way it seem to be 

cause I can tell that your watching I feel the heat when
were touching won't let it go I wanna know is it love?

maybe it's because you're tryin to be cool maybe you're
afraid of breaking the rules yeah yeah yeah yeahdon't
take me for a fool 

you can run but you can't hibe i will be right by your
side cause i been thinkking bout you thinking bout you
it's the way you make me feel you can run but you can't
hide baby you just can deny that you've been thinking
bout me thinking bout me there's nothing to conceal 

i see the look the you give me i know just what they
mean to me the games you play drives me crazy don't
fool around with this lady

boy i will teach you forever it's gotta be now or never so
let it show i wanna know is it love?

maybe it's because your tryin to be cool maybe you're
afraid of breaking the rules yeah yeah yeah yeah don't
take me for a fool 

you can run but you can hide i will be right by your side
cause i been thinking bout you thinking bout you it the
way you make me feel you can run but you canthide
baby you just can't deny that you've been thinking bout
me thinking bout me there nothing to conceal 
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hey boy looking at my back door playing me hot and
cool but you will never let go baby cause i know what it
takes know what you need playing the hide and
seekbut baby i'm here for keeps the way i'm gonna get
ya you can be sure i'm gonna let ya is it on? is it not? is
it cool? is it hot? baby you can run but you just can't
hide 

maybe it's because yuor tryin to be cool maybe your
afraid of breaking to rules yeah yeah yeah yeah don't
take me for a fool 

you can run but you can't hide i will be right by your
side the way you make me feel you can run but you
can't hide baby you jusy can't deny nothing to conceal 

coruse 3times
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