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and sometimes I wonder why you run and hide this is 
the chance of a lifetime and some times I wonder how 
it would sound pick up the phone its ringing something 
I can't describe how we stay up all night just planning 
it out right and that number stares me down when it 
comes back around it's up to you mike you'll learn to 
walk she'll grow to see you're taking first steps 
something's still lacking 'cause she never heard the 
perfect words he screams at you through me ambitions
and admirations please take this situation he's on a 
plane going down in flames still the thing that keeps 
him sane is your name he's ok I'm ok and before 
impact I stare back and you're sitting in the next seat 
to insult injury can I please go to sleep cause I'm so 
tired but I'm still wired 'cause she's like the gasoline 
and you're the machine you've driven me to singing 
three words I can't put into drive where is she tonight? 
probably with him right and now you think that you're 
broke down when she comes back around she'll pick 
you up mike hesitation motivation will take you to your
destination
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