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oh baby oooohhhh,, woah oh noooooo. oh oh oh. 6th
grade i told you to leave me laughin i don't think so i'll
passin around the room, but i just don't see you. you
are the inside outside ipidamy of what looks like to be a
rebel on the bathroom floor, it's fun it's quick, just take
it, take it slooooow. and dont you think about the show,
that chapters gone,you smoked it out and out into the
door. woah woah, so when you come back down, you
know that i'll be waiting for you. i only hope that you
wont forget my name. my nay-haayme. break down to
3rd street and how we'd scream, they kept this song,
they kept us crazy, kept this clean. but now we're in a
different scene. see one stays away when the others a
dreeeeeaam. with the level of incompatince and the
look in your eye, the look in your eye is split. hes awake
and hes breathin i'm awake and your chest is heaving
heaving, now i'm leaving, leaving. if you can speak up
with your toungue tied, untied. first you got to pray,
everyine here its too late, everyone is in touch,
everyone is a fake like. so when you come back down,
you know that i'll be waiting for you. i only hope that you
won't forget my name. the keys alive will watch you
shake, their hearts at stake.
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