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Intro:
I feel a little misunderstood, but who am I to blame, I
do my raps with a lot of metaphors and no shame, no
sir, no shame! I bring it down I let my raps decipher
every other human being! I cover them in the
metaphors n similes! You can never stop me, yes I feel
misunderstood, so bitch you donâ€™t know what
Iâ€™m saying so let me explain! Its Ice on the track
and im back where I belong, Im explaining shit that you
donâ€™t even know, and I could never do better at it,
since im at the best at it, since im giving the best at it
and im moâ€™ like im an addict, what am I to say uhh! 

Verse 1:
Yeah I am music and I live for the music. Period fact
number one. Fact number two, im always in the studio,
so if you looking for me go there! Iâ€™m probably in
the vocal booth recording another freestyle with the
double cup, Styrofoam white! I donâ€™t care what you
think of me cuzâ€™ I am who I am and I wont diverge.
Uh, a lot of people, they donâ€™t completely
understand me, especially you ladies. Just cuzâ€™ of
my title and what I do doesnâ€™t mean im that type of
person with that type of character! So donâ€™t place
me in the wrong drawer and lock it! Think twice and
then decide! Now thatâ€™s just the fact and who I am
and all I can say is go ahead and abide.

Chorus:
Yeah, I feel misunderstood, and that why im freestyling
right now in this booth! (Yeah) Just dropping all these
feelings on this mic! 

Verse 2:
Uh, I know thereâ€™s very few of you who understand
so for those people meet the real Julius. I know a lot of
you, donâ€™t know who Ice is Yeezy and Yeezy is Ice!
Now the only point im making, is that yâ€™all cant go
hate or love somebody, if you donâ€™t really know
who that person is. (Yeah)

(Music)
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Verse 3:
Uh, never lived in the hood and never discovered the
hood life. Never dealt on crack or cocaine and if I
woulda have the possibility, I would probably say no!
You can kinda see me like Chuckee, no drugs n no
weapons. Thatâ€™s the fact and thatâ€™s how it will
stay. (Uh)
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