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Poppin bottles in the ice like a blizzard when we drink
we do it right gettin' slizzard zippin ziz ziz in my right
(in my right) like a 36 now I'm feeling so fly like a g6
like a g6 like a g6 n-n-n-n now I'm feeling so fly like a
g6 like a g6 n-n-n-n now I'm feeling so fly like a g6

babe you know like I know when the sunlight comes
down there she goes strobe lights dance with the stars
I know you know don't we know watch them go when
the rain is falling down my heart is close I know she
knows strobe lights dance with the stars

Poppin bottles in the ice like a blizzard when we drink
we do it right gettin' slizzard zippin ziz ziz in my right
(in my right) like a 36 now I'm feeling so fly like a g6
like a g6 like a g6 n-n-n-n now I'm feeling so fly like a
g6 like a g6 n-n-n-n now I'm feeling so fly like a g6

I know I know I know that you're nothing I know I know I
know that me feel nothing more I let you have more let
me the strides I can't feel awake I know I know I know
that the spell is gone I know I know I know The lights
and stars awake and the stars gonna die it's making
me making me baby

Poppin bottles in the ice like a blizzard when we drink
we do it right gettin' slizzard zippin ziz ziz in my right
(in my right) like a 36 now I'm feeling so fly like a g6

and when the lights awake and i'm gonna turn away
and let ya hug up to me it's so fast like a g6 baby we're
going the wrong way and baby you are gone and I feel
awake oh and you baby.. (Poppin in the ice like a g6)
and oh baby and title on the merge that dirty money fly
like a g7
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