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From the back, from the front, from the side I wanna
fuck her with the lights on. From the back, from the
front, from the side baby what you want. From the
back, from the front, from the side I wanna fuck her
with the lights on. From the back, from the front, from
the side baby what you want. 

Put your legs on top of me when I freak, you freak, we
freak. I wanna fuck her with the lights on. Put your legs
on top of me when I freak, you freak, we freak. I wanna
fuck her with the lights on. Put your legs on top of me
when I freak, you freak, we freak. I wanna fuck her with
the lights on. Put your legs on top of me when I freak,
you freak, we freak yeah. 

I was in the back of a club with a chick, face look good
with a ass so sick. Achoo. Wanna take her to the crib, I
do a couple grand in the club. I blew, see the money
ain't shit all I could think little mama getting hit from all
directions, when we sexin please believe I got
protection. She asked for platinum wrappers I popped
them magnum wrappers. You know what happens
after, there's magic in the master. Shes bowing to her
master, I throw her up and catch her. Her praise is
faster, faster. I reply with laughter, laughter. 

From the back, from the front, from the side I wanna
fuck her with the lights on. From the back, from the
front, from the side baby what you want. From the
back, from the front, from the side I wanna fuck her
with the lights on. From the back, from the front, from
the side baby what you want. 

Put your legs on top of me when I freak, you freak, we
freak. I wanna fuck her with the lights on. Put your legs
on top of me when I freak, you freak, we freak. I wanna
fuck her with the lights on. Put your legs on top of me
when I freak, you freak, we freak. I wanna fuck her with
the lights on. Put your legs on top of me when I freak,
you freak, we freak yeah. 

Ask me what my name and I will tell the girl its mister. I
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pull her in all types of positions like playing twister, she
got buhu flexibility, stamina and agillity. She just don't
know when I go down low I got porn star ability. Shes
screamin as shes moanin vibrating just like my cellular,
follows directions well by gosh I love sexin her. 

From the back, from the front, from the side I wanna
fuck her with the lights on. From the back, from the
front, from the side baby what you want. From the
back, from the front, from the side I wanna fuck her
with the lights on. From the back, from the front, from
the side baby what you want. 

Put your legs on top of me when I freak, you freak, we
freak. I wanna fuck her with the lights on. Put your legs
on top of me when I freak, you freak, we freak. I wanna
fuck her with the lights on. Put your legs on top of me
when I freak, you freak, we freak. I wanna fuck her with
the lights on. Put your legs on top of me when I freak,
you freak, we freak yeah.
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