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(Quez) verse 1- Lay ya body down just so I can touch
ya. I'm hopen dat ya ready cuz ion wanna rush ya. and
just to set the mode I put on a lil usher. and now we
trading places and wrestlin unda covers. ten to fifteen
I'm ready ta blast off y we playn under cover I'm takn
ha pants off like mann now she want me to b ha man
nd then I said man and she brought anotha friend.

Chours- get naked.take yo clothes off wipe of yo lip
gloss yo body so soft. she naked I luv the way she
moving and we shud make a movie I love the way she
do me. we"re naked (oooh yeea)(ooh yeea)she naked
(ooh yeea ) (ooh yeea)

(Strap) verse 2- girl come get dis dickey (cum here)
umm umm gud she say strap yuh finger likcn liisten
shorty can I tell yuh sumthiing it's yuh dat ii been
wantiin. I luv yo body structure. it got me super sprung
nd I bet wen yuh butt naked dat thang go stupid dumb.
wer yuh get dat azz from? she say from my mama. lets
take off yo pamajas let me watch yuh cook lasagna
ummm. girl yuh know yuh bad. flip flop on yo ass I'll
give yuh sum yuh never had. lets play adam and eve.
I'm messn up yo weave. girl give me sum so I can roll
up yo weave.

Chorus- get naked.take yo clothes off wipe of yo lip
gloss yo body so soft. she naked I luv the way she
moving and we shud make a movie I love the way you
do me. we"re naked (oooh yeea)(ooh yeea)she naked
(ooh yeea ) (ooh yeea)

(Ali) verse 3- take yo pants off. take yo panties off. take
yo socks off. fuck it take it all off. I hope it aint a issue. I
aint gone kiss yuh. but I mite lick yuh. from yo neck to
yo ankle. girl I'm nasty I mite spank yuh. I aint cum here
to tease yuh girl. I came here to please yuh. and we
touchn and we rubbin and we freakin and we vibin and
she like it. we aint kissin we aint hunchin. we fuckin.

Chorus- get naked.take yo clothes off wipe of yo lip
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gloss yo body so soft. she naked I luv the way she
move nd we shud make a movie I love the way you do
me.we"re naked (oooh yeea)(ooh yeea)she naked (ooh
yeea ) (ooh yeea)
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