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Oooh.

(Chorus):

There's so many girls in here I don't even kno who to
choose from dere so many girls in here they look so
sexy I don't kno how to choose one I'm thinkin now that
it can b u I drunk too much patron jus anotha couple
shots than I'm thinkin bout I'm mite b on and now that
I'm choosin I choose u girl wat u gonna do club closed
lets go so I can give it to u

Meek
Verse1:
Cuties to my left shawtys to my right iny miny miney
moe who cumin home tonite stacks on deck patron on
ice tell me wat ya need I give ya wat ya like
So many girls in nere that I don't even kno who to
choose from I swear I said I step in da club fly as a lair
(mel luv u c dat lil bitch rite dere wit da red on tell her
cum mere)

(Chorus):

There's so many girls in here I don't even kno who to
choose from dere so many girls in here they look so
sexy I don't kno how to choose one I'm thinkin now that
it can b u I drunk too much patron jus anotha couple
shots than I'm thinkin bout I'm mite b on and now that
I'm choosin I choose u girl wat u gonna do club closed
lets go so I can give it to u

Verse2:
Start wit straight shots then we pop da rosey I step
aside they b lookin at me like they kno me neck on
bling my wrist wear glowin I turn em on cuz dey kno I'm
ballin like I'm Kobe but I don't like em boojie I wanna
hood jawn lip gloss poppin ass fat ugggs on wit a gucci
bag lookin supa badd them hoes don't see u when we
dere dats y u supa madd.

(Chorus):
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There's so many girls in here I don't even kno who to
choose from dere so many girls in here they look so
sexy I don't kno how to choose one I'm thinkin now that
it can b u I drunk too much patron jus anotha couple
shots than I'm thinkin bout I'm mite b on and now that
I'm choosin I choose u girl wat u gonna do club closed
lets go so I can give it to u
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