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I can see in my own true hopes and dreams they are
surreal. Captivate by my true laugh I want you to feel.
You apologize put down your lies I do not so I
sympathize. You turned your back and that was that
your what we what we could of had. Oh Oh Oh. 
Chrous:
Cause IÂ’m fine without. I just wanted to let you know
that you canÂ’t came and go you leave you know. You
should of thought of that before like I said I am fine
without you I just wanted to let you know because the
world you know is so second grade typical. You come
and go. 
You put my heart on a string around your neck and
wore it proud for all to see. I wish you were who you use
to be. So I gotta be strong gotta keep movinÂ’ on.
Cause your singinÂ’ my song your singinÂ’ it wrong
and IÂ’m laughing cause IÂ’m so glad that you said
goodbye. Chrous:
Cause IÂ’m fine without. I just wanted to let you know
that you canÂ’t came and go you leave you know. You
should of thought of that before like I said I am fine
without you I just wanted to let you know because the
world you know is so second grade typical. You come
and go. 
(We go.) Your body a deception of lies. Doing anything
with anybody for bragging rights. (And you are) when
you sit down and cry you should think how (why). IÂ’ve
moved on and IÂ’m proving you wrong the proof is in
the lyrics so just listen to your song. 
Chrous:
Cause IÂ’m fine without. I just wanted to let you know
that you canÂ’t came and go you leave you know. You
should of thought of that before like I said I am fine
without you I just wanted to let you know because the
world you know is so second grade typical. You come
and go.
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