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Honey your words cut so deep when we both know you
don't mean it. How did we let things get so far out of
hand now it's all awkward silence. This time we'll
apologize for all our mistakes. This time the lines we'll
retrace will bring us both back home. The looks you
give me always makes me regret what I say the
moment it leaves my lips. So honestly, honesty. What
are you waiting for? We can't cover the same ground
each time an argument comes up in conversation. It's
too bad now, it's too late. Honey your words cut so
deep when we both know you don't mean it. how did we
let things get so far out of hand now it's all awkward
silence. This time we'll apologize for all our mistakes.
This time the lines we'll retrace will bring us both back
home. Aren't you forgetting something? That's right I
left my heart on my sleeve so you can take it. I'll let you
break it. Why do we do this to ourselves? Why do you
let me? Show me something other than this. I've seen
enough. No more promises at least for now. Honey
your words cut so deep when we both know you don't
mean it. How did we let things get so far out of hand
now it's all awkward silence. This time we'll apologize
for all our mistakes. This time the lines we'll retrace will
bring us both back home
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